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Bid Tabulation

ITB 80-19R

FRESH PRODUCE

SANDRA TELLIS, PRINCIPAL BUYER, PH: 205-325-5382

1 2 3
O.K. PRODUCE REGIONAL PRODUCE FORESTWOOD FARM INC.
ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICING- | PRICING- | PRICING- | PRICING- | PRICING- |UOM/CASE/| PRICING- | PRICING- | PRICING- | PRICING- | PRICING- |UOM/CASE/| PRICING - | PRICING - | PRICING - | PRICING - | PRICING - | UOM/CASE
REGION 1 | REGION 2 | REGION 3 | REGION 4 | REGION5 | COUNT | REGION1 | REGION2 | REGION3 | REGION4 | REGION5 | COUNT |REGION1 |REGION2 | REGION3 | REGION4 | REGIONS5 | /COUNT
1 APPLES, FUJI -88 CT CS $25.95] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $24.85 $24.85 $24.85 $29.85 $28.85 $28.95 $28.95 $28.95 $32.95 $30.95
2 APPLES, FUJI 113-138 CT $26.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.50 $23.50 $23.50 $28.50 $27.50 $28.95 $28.95 $28.95 $32.95 $30.95
3 APPLES, GALA 80-88 CT $25.95 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $24.85 $24.85 $24.85 $29.85 $28.85 $28.95 $28.95 $28.95 $32.95 $30.95
4 APPLES, GALA 125-138 CS $27.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.50 $23.50 $23.50 $28.50 $27.50 $26.95 $26.95 $26.95 $30.95 $28.95
5 APPLE, GOLD 88 CT CS $25.95 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $24.85 $24.85 $24.85 $29.85 $28.85 $28.95 $28.95 $28.95 $32.95 $30.95
6 APPLES, GOLD 125 CT CS $27.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.50 $23.50 $23.50 $28.50 $27.50 $26.95 $26.95 $26.95 $30.95 $28.95
7 APPLES GRANNY SMITH 125-138 CS $27.95 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.50 $23.50 $23.50 $28.50 $27.50 $29.95 $29.95 $29.95 $33.95 $31.95
8 APPLES GRANNY SMITH 88 CT CS $27.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $24.85 $24.85 $24.85 $29.85 $28.85 $32.95 $32.95 $32.95 $36.95 $34.95
9 APPLES, RED 88 CT CS $25.95 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $24.85 $24.85 $24.85 $29.85 $28.85 $28.95 $28.95 $28.95 $32.95 $30.95
10 APPLES, RED 125-138 CS $27.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.50 $23.50 $23.50 $28.50 $27.50 $26.95 $26.95 $26.95 $30.95 $28.95
11 ARUGULA, BABY 4 LB CS $4.95] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.50 $12.50 $12.50 $17.50 $16.50 $18.95 $18.95 $18.95 $22.95 $20.95
12 ASPARAGUS, STANDARD 11 LB CS $9.95 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $27.50 $27.50 $27.50 $33.50 $32.50 $26.95 $26.95 $26.95 $30.95 $28.95
13 AVOCADOS, RIPE CS $19.95 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $29.50 $29.50 $29.50 $34.50 $33.50 $36.95 $36.95 $36.95 $40.95 $38.95
14 BANANAS, GREEN TURBO 40 LB CS $18.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.00 $18.00 $18.00 $23.00 $22.00 $18.95 $18.95 $18.95 $22.95 $20.95
15 BANANAS, MEDIUM TURBO 40 LB CS $18.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.00 $18.00 $18.00 $23.00 $22.00 $18.95 $18.95 $18.95 $22.95 $20.95
16 BANANAS, RIPE TURBO 40 LB CS $18.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.00 $18.00 $18.00 $23.00 $22.00 $18.95 $18.95 $18.95 $22.95 $20.95
17 BASIL LB $2.95 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $13.00 $12.00 $10.95 $10.95 $10.95 $14.95 $12.95
18 BLACKBERRIES CS $19.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $25.85 $25.85 $25.85 $32.85 $31.85 $28.95 $28.95 $28.95 $32.95 $30.95
19 BLUEBERRIES 12 CS $22.95 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $25.85 $25.85 $25.85 $32.85 $31.85 $28.95 $28.95 $28.95 $32.95 $30.95
20 BROCCOLI CROWN 20 LB/CS $22.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.85 $19.85 $19.85 $25.85 $14.85 $24.95 $24.95 $24.95 $28.95 $26.95
21 BROCCOLI 14 CTCS $21.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.85 $19.85 $19.85 $24.85 $23.85 $24.95 $24.95 $24.95 $28.95 $26.95
22 BROCCOLI, FLORETTES 6/3 LB CS $29.95 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.85 $26.85 $26.85 $31.85 $30.85 $29.95 $29.95 $29.95 $33.95 $31.95
23 CABBAGE, 1”x 1”7 4/5 LB CS $13.95 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.85 $21.85 $21.85 $26.85 $25.85 $19.95 $19.95 $19.95 $23.95 $21.95
24 CABBAGE, GREEN 50LB CTN $9.95] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.85 $19.85 $19.85 $24.85 $23.85 $21.95 $21.95 $21.95 $25.95 $23.95
25 CANTALOUPE CS $18.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.85 $18.85 $18.85 $23.85 $22.85 $24.95 $24.95 $24.95 $28.95 $26.95
26 CARROT STICKS, 4/5LB CS $15.95] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.85 $26.85 $26.85 $31.85 $30.85 $29.95 $29.95 $29.95 $33.95 $31.95
27 CARROTEENIES 200/1.6 OZ. 4/5 LB CS $27.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $24.85 $24.85 $24.85 $29.85 $28.85 $28.95 $28.95 $28.95 $32.95 $30.95
28 CARROTS, BABY 30/1 LB $28.25| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $25.85 $25.85 $25.85 $30.85 $29.85 $28.95 $28.95 $28.95 $32.95 $30.95
29 CARROTS, BABY 4/5LB CS $19.95 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.85 $19.85 $19.85 $24.85 $23.85 $24.95 $24.95 $24.95 $28.95 $26.95
30 CARROTS, JUMBO 50 LB BG $9.95] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.85 $18.85 $18.85 $22.85 $22.85 $24.95 $24.95 $24.95 $28.95 $26.95
31 CARROTS, SHREDDED 4/5 LB CS $19.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.85 $15.85 $15.85 $20.85 $19.85 $21.95 $21.95 $21.95 $25.95 $23.95
32 CAULIFLOWER FLORETTES 4/3 LB $26.75| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $27.85 $27.85 $27.85 $33.85 $32.85 $28.95 $28.95 $28.95 $32.95 $30.95
33 CAULIFLOWER 12 CT CS $18.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.85 $17.85 $17.85 $23.85 $22.85 $26.95 $26.95 $26.95 $30.95 $28.95
34 CELERY CS 36 CT CS $18.75] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.85 $19.85 $19.85 $24.85 $23.85 $28.95 $28.95 $28.95 $32.95 $30.95
35 CELERY, DICED 4/5LB CS $19.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.85 $26.85 $26.85 $31.85 $30.85 $24.95 $24.95 $24.95 $28.95 $26.95
36 CELERY, STICKS 4/5 LB CS $24.95] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $27.85 $27.85 $27.85 $33.85 $32.85 $28.95 $28.95 $28.95 $32.95 $30.95
37 CILANTRO, CLEAN, TRIM 4/1 LB CS $2.95 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.85 $14.85 $14.85 $19.85 $18.85 $21.95 $21.95 $21.95 $25.95 $23.95
38 CLEMENTINES 3 LB BG $1.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.00 $7.00 $7.00 $12.00 $11.00 $8.95 $8.95 $8.95 $12.95 $10.95
39 COLLARDS, CLEANED 2x2 CUT 2/5 LB $2.95 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.85 $17.85 $17.85 $23.85 $22.85 $19.95 $19.95 $19.95 $23.95 $21.95
40 CORN, YELLOW BU BU $9.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.85 $15.85 $15.85 $20.85 $19.85 $26.95 $26.95 $26.95 $30.95 $28.95
41 CUCUMBERS, 1-1/9 TH BU 45 LB CS $17.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.85 $15.85 $15.85 $20.85 $19.85 $24.95 $24.95 $24.95 $28.95 $26.95
42 DILL LB BG $2.95] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $15.00 $14.00 $10.95 $10.95 $10.95 $14.95 $12.95
43 EGGPLANT, 1-1/9TH BU BU $4.75] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $20.00 $19.00 $24.95 $24.95 $24.95 $28.95 $26.95
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44 EGGS, MEDIUM 15 DZ $16.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.50 $17.50 $17.50 $23.50 $22.50 $21.95 $21.95 $21.95 $25.95 $23.95
45 EGGS, XLARGE 15DZ CS $16.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.50 $19.50 $19.50 $24.50 $23.50 $24.95 $24.95 $24.95 $28.95 $26.95
46 GARLIC, PEELED 4/5LB CS $9.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $40.00 $39.00 $46.95 $46.95 $46.95 $50.95 $48.95
47 GRAPEFRUIT, RED CTN $13.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.85 $23.85 $23.85 $28.85 $27.85 $26.95 $26.95 $26.95 $30.95 $28.95
48 GRAPES, RED SEEDLESS 18 LB CS $27.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $24.00 $24.00 $24.00 $29.00 $28.00 $26.95 $26.95 $26.95 $30.95 $28.95
49 GRAPES, WHITE SEEDLESS 18 LB CS $28.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $25.85 $25.85 $25.85 $30.85 $29.85 $28.95 $28.95 $28.95 $32.95 $30.95
50 HONEYDEW MELONS 8 CT CS $18.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.85 $16.85 $16.85 $21.85 $20.85 $21.95 $21.95 $21.95 $25.95 $23.95
51 KALE, GREEN 24 CT CS $17.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.85 $15.85 $15.85 $20.85 $19.85 $21.95 $21.95 $21.95 $25.95 $23.95
52 KIWI FLAT 39 CT CS $13.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.00 $14.00 $14.00 $19.00 $18.00 $14.95 $14.95 $14.95 $18.95 $16.95
53 LEEKS PER CS 12 CT CS $2.75| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.50 $14.50 $14.50 $19.50 $14.50 $28.95 $28.95 $28.95 $32.95 $30.95
54 LEMONS, 200 CHOICE 200 CT CS $19.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.85 $23.85 $23.85 $28.85 $27.85 $34.95 $34.95 $34.95 $38.95 $36.95
55 LETTUCE, ICEBERG PREMIUM 24 CT CS $19.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.50 $18.50 $18.50 $23.50 $22.50 $25.95 $25.95 $25.95 $29.95 $27.95
56 LETTUCE, LEAF 24 CT CS $19.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.85 $19.85 $19.85 $24.85 $23.85 $25.95 $25.95 $25.95 $29.95 $27.95
57 LETTUCE, LEAF CROWNS 10 LB CS $18.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.85 $18.85 $18.85 $23.85 $22.85 $23.95 $23.95 $23.95 $27.95 $25.95
58 LETTUCE, ROMAINE 24 CT CS $19.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.85 $23.85 $23.85 $28.85 $27.85 $25.95 $25.95 $25.95 $29.95 $27.95
59 LETTUCE, ROMAINE CHOPPED 6/2 LB CS $19.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.35 $18.35 $18.35 $24.35 $23.35 $19.95 $19.95 $19.95 $23.95 $21.95
60 LETTUCE, SHREDDED 4/5LB CS $18.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.85 $14.85 $14.85 $19.85 $18.85 $18.95 $18.95 $18.95 $22.95 $20.95
61 LIMES 40 LB CS $5.75| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.50 $17.50 $17.50 $23.50 $22.50 $32.95 $32.95 $32.95 $36.95 $34.95
62 MANGO CTN $7.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.50 $8.50 $8.50 $13.50 $12.50 $18.95 $18.95 $18.95 $22.95 $20.95
63 MINT LB $1.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.00 $7.00 $7.00 $13.00 $12.00 $10.95 $10.95 $10.95 $14.95 $12.95
64 MUSHROOM, SLICED 5LBCS $7.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.00 $9.00 $9.00 $14.00 $13.00 $11.95 $11.95 $11.95 $15.95 $13.95
65 MUSHROOM, BUTTON 10 LB CS $10.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.00 $16.00 $16.00 $21.00 $20.00 $20.95 $20.95 $20.95 $24.95 $22.95
66 MUSHROOM, MEDIUM 10 LB CS $10.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.00 $16.00 $16.00 $21.00 $20.00 $19.95 $19.95 $19.95 $23.95 $21.95
67 NECTARINE CS CS $23.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.50 $21.50 $21.50 $26.50 $25.50 $28.95 $28.95 $28.95 $32.95 $30.95
68 ONIONS, ICELESS GREEN 4/2 LB CS $9.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.85 $15.85 $15.85 $20.85 $19.85 $18.95 $18.95 $18.95 $22.95 $20.95
69 ONIONS, RED JUMBO 25 LB BG $9.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.85 $15.85 $15.85 $20.85 $19.85 $21.95 $21.95 $21.95 $25.95 $23.95
70 ONIONS, SWEET 40 LB CS $14.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.50 $13.50 $13.50 $18.50 $17.50 $28.95 $28.95 $28.95 $32.95 $30.95
71 ONIONS, YELLOW DICED 4/5 LB CS $14.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.85 $23.85 $23.85 $28.85 $27.85 $24.95 $24.95 $24.95 $28.95 $26.95
72 ONIONS, YELLOW JUMBO EA $0.30| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $2.50 $2.50 $0.30 $0.30 $0.30 $0.70 $0.50
73 ORANGES 113-125 CT $25.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.85 $23.85 $23.85 $28.85 $28.85 $26.95 $26.95 $26.95 $30.95 $28.95
74 ORANGES 72 - 88 CT/CS $22.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.85 $23.85 $23.85 $28.85 $28.85 $28.95 $28.95 $28.95 $32.95 $30.95
75 PARSLEY, CURLEY 60 CT/CS $2.75| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $20.00 $19.00 $28.95 $28.95 $28.95 $32.95 $30.95
76 PEACHES CTN CS $15.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.50 $21.50 $21.50 $26.50 $24.50 $26.95 $26.95 $26.95 $30.95 $28.95
77 PEARS BULK CASE CTN $19.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.00 $26.00 $26.00 $30.00 $30.00 $28.95 $28.95 $28.95 $32.95 $30.95
78 PEPPER, GREEN BELL CS $13.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $20.00 $19.00 $26.95 $26.95 $26.95 $30.95 $28.95
79 PEPPER, RED BELL 1-1/9 BSL $14.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.50 $15.50 $15.50 $20.50 $19.50 $32.95 $32.95 $32.95 $36.95 $34.95
80 PEPPER, YELLOW BELL 1-1/9 BSL $14.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.50 $15.50 $15.50 $20.50 $19.50 $32.95 $32.95 $32.95 $36.95 $34.95
81 PINEAPPLE GOLD CTN $14.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.85 $15.85 $15.85 $20.85 $19.85 $18.95 $18.95 $18.95 $22.95 $20.95
82 PLUMS, RED CTN $22.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.50 $21.50 $21.50 $26.50 $25.50 $26.95 $26.95 $26.95 $30.95 $28.95
83 POTATOES, ARED 50 LB CS $10.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $20.00 $19.00 $18.95 $18.95 $18.95 $22.95 $20.95
84 POTATOES, 1 LB SWEET 40LBCS $14.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $20.00 $20.00 $18.95 $18.95 $18.95 $22.95 $20.95
85 POTATOES, 100 CT IDAHO 50 LB/100 CT CS $18.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.00 $16.00 $16.00 $21.00 $20.00 $18.95 $18.95 $18.95 $22.95 $20.95
86 POTATOES, 60 CT 50 LB CS $16.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.50 $18.50 $18.50 $22.50 $21.50 $20.95 $20.95 $20.95 $24.95 $22.95
87 POTATOES, 70 CT 50 LB CS $16.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.50 $18.50 $18.50 $22.50 $21.50 $20.95 $20.95 $20.95 $24.95 $22.95
88 POTATOES, 80 CT IDAHO 50 LB CS $17.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.50 $17.50 $17.50 $21.50 $20.50 $19.95 $19.95 $19.95 $23.95 $21.95
89 POTATO, B RED 50 LB BG $17.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.00 $16.00 $16.00 $21.00 $20.00 $21.95 $21.95 $21.95 $25.95 $23.95
90 POTATOES, JUMBO SWEET 40 LB CS $14.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.50 $15.50 $15.50 $21.50 $20.50 $16.95 $16.95 $16.95 $20.95 $18.95
91 RADISHES, 30/6 OZ CS $15.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.50 $17.50 $17.50 $23.50 $22.50 $18.95 $18.95 $18.95 $22.95 $20.95
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92 RASPBERRIES 12/1 PINT CT $1.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $25.85 $25.85 $25.85 $30.85 $29.85 $34.95 $34.95 $34.95 $38.95 $36.95
93 SALAD MIX W/SIDE COLOR 4/5LB $18.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.00 $16.00 $16.00 $21.00 $20.00 $16.95 $16.95 $16.95 $20.95 $18.95
94 SLAW, CHOPPED SIDE COLOR 4/5 LB $14.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.00 $16.00 $16.00 $21.00 $20.00 $16.95 $16.95 $16.95 $20.95 $18.95
95 SLAW, SHREDDED SIDE COLOR 4/5 LB CS $14.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.00 $16.00 $16.00 $21.00 $21.00 $16.95 $16.95 $16.95 $20.95 $18.95
96 SPINACH, BABY BULK 4 LB $5.95| NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $20.00 $19.00 $16.95 $16.95 $16.95 $20.95 $18.95
97 SPINACH, CUT & WASHED 4/2.5 LB BULK NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.50 $18.50 $18.50 $23.50 $23.50 $18.95 $18.95 $18.95 $22.95 $20.95
98 SPRING MIX, 3 LB BOX SWEET $9.75| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.00 $12.00 $12.00 $17.00 $17.00 $10.95 $10.95 $10.95 $14.95 $12.95
99 SQUASH, CHOICE YELLOW $12.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.00 $16.00 $16.00 $22.00 $21.00 $19.95 $19.95 $19.95 $23.95 $21.95
100 SQUASH., ZUCCHINI MED 18 LB $12.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.00 $16.00 $16.00 $22.00 $21.00 $19.95 $19.95 $19.95 $23.95 $21.95
101 STRAWBERRIES, 8/1 QT CS $17.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.85 $21.85 $21.85 $26.85 $25.85 $21.95 $21.95 $21.95 $25.95 $23.95
102 TANGERINES, CASE $23.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.85 $23.85 $23.85 $28.85 $27.85 $28.95 $28.95 $28.95 $32.95 $30.95
103 TOMATOES, 5X6 25 LB $19.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.00 $22.00 $22.00 $27.00 $27.00 $21.95 $21.95 $21.95 $25.95 $23.95
104 TOMATOES, 5X6 FLAT $16.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.00 $22.00 $22.00 $27.00 $27.00 $21.95 $21.95 $21.95 $25.95 $23.95
105 TOMATOES, 6X6 25 LB $19.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.00 $22.00 $22.00 $27.00 $27.00 $21.95 $21.95 $21.95 $25.95 $23.95
106 TOMATOES, CHERRY 12/PT FLAT $14.75| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.00 $20.00 $20.00 $25.00 $24.00 $21.95 $21.95 $21.95 $25.95 $23.95
107 TOMATOES, FOODSERVICE -SCH $8.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.00 $20.00 $20.00 $25.00 $24.00 $18.95 $18.95 $18.95 $22.95 $20.95
108 TOMATOES, GRAP 12 CT FLAT $16.95| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.00 $19.00 $19.00 $24.00 $23.00 $19.95 $19.95 $19.95 $23.95 $21.95
109 TOMATOES, ROMA 25 LB CS $14.75| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.00 $19.00 $19.00 $24.00 $23.00 $19.95 $19.95 $19.95 $23.95 $21.95
110 WATERMELON EA $5.50| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.50 $6.50 $6.50 $10.00 $10.00 $6.95 $6.95 $6.95 $10.95 $8.95
GRAND TOTAL PER REGION| $1,792.95 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,097.70 $2,102.70 $2,102.70 $2,659.95 $2,547.95 $2,593.85| $2,593.85| $2,593.85 $3,030.25| $2,812.05
MINIMUM ORDER PER DELIVERY $0.00| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $150.00 $100.00 $100.00f  $350.00 $175.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00| 15 Cases 15 Cases

CREDIT CARD % FEES - - - - - * * * * * 3% 3% 3% 3% 3%

Notification of Intent to Respond YES YES YES

Experience Statement YES YES YES

Non-Collusion Affidavit YES YES YES

EEOC Form YES YES YES

Debarment Statement YES YES YES

Affidavit of Contractor (E-Verify) YES YES YES

Signature Page YES YES YES

Purchasing Association of Central Alabama
(PACA) Pages YES YES YES

CONTACTS:

1. REGIONAL PRODUCE/624 16TH AVENUE WEST BIRMINGHAM AL 35204 /CONTACT: STEPHEN ALLEN /PH: (205) 324-4569 FAX: (800) 421-2740 EMAIL: SALES@REGIONALPRODUCE.NET

2. FORESTWOOD FARM INC./P.O. BOX 310728 BIRMINGHAM AL 35231 /CONTACT: RANDY SCOTT PH:(205) 252-4139 FAX: (205) 324-1054 EMAIL: RANDY @FORESTWOOD.COM

3. 0.K. PRODUCE/ P.O0. BOX 791 FLORENCE AL 35631/ CONTACT: JADE KEETON PH: (256) 710-9523 FAX: (256) 766-5879 EMAIL: OKPRODUCE@BELLSOUTH.NET




